
$1,800 - 1 Washington Ave, Coxsackie
MLS® #147040 

$1,800
2 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 1,200 sqft
Rental on 0 Acres

N/A, Coxsackie, NY

Newly renovated! Be the first to live in this
stunning historic home. Lovely 2BR, 1 Bath
semi-attached townhouse, with off street
parking. Updated electric, recessed lighting,
plenty of closets and new appliances. Front
porch provides stunning views, and the
backyard plenty of opportunities for fun in the
summer. Centrally located inside of historic
downtown Coxsackie, convenient to NYS
Thruway. Non-smoking property, pets
welcome. Tenant pays heat, hot water, electric
and cable, landlord provides water, sewer,
trash removal. lawn maintenance, and snow
removal. First month rent and security deposit
due at lease signing. Landlord will split broker
fee with tenant. Application must be completed
prior to showing. Land lord requires
application, credit check and employment
verification.

Built in 1853

Essential Information

MLS® # 147040

Price $1,800

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 1.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 1,200

Acres 0.28

Year Built 1853



Type Rental

Sub-Type Apartment

Status Rented

MLS cgndmls_sold

Community Information

Address 1 Washington Ave

Area Coxsackie

Subdivision N/A

City Coxsackie

County Greene

State NY

Zip Code 12051

Exterior

Construction Frame

Foundation Stone

Additional Information

Date Listed July 1st, 2023

Days on Market 31


