
$535,000 - 286 W Hill Rd, New Lebanon
MLS® #152159 

$535,000
4 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 2,164 sqft
Residential on 16 Acres

N/A, New Lebanon, NY

Beautifully situated off a quiet country road in
the the New Lebanon Hills, this private 16 acre
property offers views, a spring fed swimming
pond and plenty of space to play. The bright
and airy home features an open floor plan with
large picture windows framing the views. A
large wrap around deck extends the living
space outdoors and is anchored on one end
by a screened sleeping porch. The first floor
also offers a wood burning stove, den,
sunroom, and a bedroom with a jack and jill
bathroom with laundry. In a nod to the history
of the area, you will find 3 authentic antique
Shaker doors on the first floor as well. Upstairs
you'll find 3 bedrooms, a full bath with a bidet,
and 2 large walk in closets and attic storage
space. There is plenty of space for friends and
family. The basement has a finished rec room
and a work shop area. Solar panels reduce
your energy cost and are connected to a
battery storage system, giving you peace of
mind during a power outage.There is a
detached 2 car garage, with a lean to shed on
the back for your lawn equipment and a bonus
studio space above the garage. Carport for
convenience and wood storage. Close to the
Berkshires, Skiing, and Tanglewood.

Built in 1994

Essential Information

MLS® # 152159

Price $535,000



Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 2,164

Acres 16.30

Year Built 1994

Type Residential

Sub-Type Residential

Style 1 1/2 Stories, 2 Stories, Contemporary

Status Sold

MLS cgndmls_sold

Community Information

Address 286 W Hill Rd

Area New Lebanon

Subdivision N/A

City New Lebanon

County Columbia

State NY

Zip Code 12125

Amenities

# of Garages 2

Garages Carport, Detached

View Berkshire, Country, Seasonal, Wooded

Interior

Appliances Clothes Dryer, Clothes Washer, Dishwasher, Freezer, Refrigerator,
Stove, Other

Heating Forced, Hot Air

Has Basement Yes

Basement Dry, Finished, Full

Exterior

Exterior Wood

Windows Insulated

Roof Asphalt

Construction Frame

Foundation Poured Concrete



School Information

District New Lebanon

Additional Information

Date Listed April 8th, 2024

Days on Market 8

Zoning RA2/5


