
$4,500 - 310 Union St, Hudson
MLS® #152741 

$4,500
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,628 sqft
Rental on 0 Acres

N/A, Hudson, NY

A wonderfully maintained Queen Anne
Victorian home in the heart of Hudson with
original period details and stunning wood
floors throughout. Enter from the front porch
into the elegant foyer with its grand staircase.
The hallway opens to the light-filled living room
with a stunning original fireplace. Gorgeous
pocket doors lead through to the large dining
room, with its own wood burning fireplace. The
updated kitchen has stone counters, a
wonderful beadboard ceiling and room for a
table overlooking the rear porch and spacious
garden. Upstairs are three bedrooms including
a large primary suite with beautiful floors,
sitting area and walk-in closet. A fabulous 19th
century linen closet provides ample additional
storage in the hallway, and a secondary
staircase goes down to the kitchen. One of the
best streets in Hudson, steps from shops,
restaurants, galleries, and only a five-minute
walk to Amtrak and the riverfront.

Built in 1890

Essential Information

MLS® # 152741

Price $4,500

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 1

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 1,628



Acres 0.07

Year Built 1890

Type Rental

Sub-Type House

Status Rented

MLS cgndmls_sold

Community Information

Address 310 Union St

Area Hudson

Subdivision N/A

City Hudson

County Columbia

State NY

Zip Code 12534

Exterior

Construction Frame, Stone

Foundation Stone

Additional Information

Date Listed May 16th, 2024


