
$299,000 - 343 Cascade Drive, Kingston
MLS® #20232832 

$299,000
3 Bedroom, 2.50 Bathroom, 1,812 sqft
Residential on 0 Acres

N/A, Kingston, NY

This is your corner of the world. Tucked away
in the Whittier neighborhood with an expansive
lawn is an adorable 3 Bed / 2.5 Bath with a
deck overlooking the yard, and an oversized 2
car garage. There is a breakfast bar in the
kitchen, and an open living dining area with
tons of light and warm wood floors. Entertain
on the deck just off the kitchen and dining
area. Or barbecue on the patio while enjoying
a football game downstairs. There's a full bath
in the hall, and 3 lovely bedrooms.  The main
bedroom is ensuite.  The owner is currently
using upstairs as 2 bedrooms yet it could
easily be restored to 3.  Downstairs makes live
easy.  Come in from the garage to a
downstairs den/family room.  Or use it as
another bedroom.  There's a great bathroom
downstairs and a full wall of handmade,
built-in, shelving and storage space/desk
space/secret nooks.  If you have dogs the
lawn is fully fenced and ready to go and the
neighborhood is ready to accommodate. 
Close to Kingston/Rhinecliff bridge, Saugerties
and uptown Kingston.  A pleasure to show and
see.

Built in 1990

Essential Information

MLS® # 20232832

Price $299,000

Bedrooms 3



Bathrooms 2.50

Full Baths 2

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 1,812

Acres 0.31

Year Built 1990

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Raised Ranch

Status Closed

MLS ucbr_sold

Community Information

Address 343 Cascade Drive

Area Ulster-Town Of

Subdivision N/A

City Kingston

County Ulster

State NY

Zip Code 12401

Amenities

Parking Driveway, Underground, Other

# of Garages 2

Interior

Interior Features Breakfast Bar, Eat-in Kitchen, High Speed Internet, Kitchen Island

Appliances Washer, Range Hood, Range, Oven, Dryer, Dishwasher

Heating Baseboard, Natural Gas

Has Basement Yes

Basement Finished

Fireplace Yes

Fireplaces Basement, Gas

Exterior

Exterior Frame

Lot Description Corner Lot, Level

Roof Asphalt, Shingle

Construction Frame



School Information

District Saugerties Central Schools

Additional Information

Date Listed September 27th, 2023

Days on Market 295

Zoning R- 1


