
$589,000 - 51 Greene, Catskill
MLS® #150521 

$589,000
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,600 sqft
Residential on 0 Acres

N/A, Catskill, NY

A charming village house in the victorian
Italianate style, perched on a quiet side street
just off Main Street. The double verandas are
a special feature offering long distant views
from the upper level. High ceilings and large
windows elevate each room to a level of
comfort and grace often found only in larger
houses. A soft color palette inside adds to the
sense of calm along with many other lovely
touches created by the current owner. A
ground floor bedroom is perfect for guests and
the formal dining room will find much use as it
overlooks the vest pocket rear garden through
a full glass door. This is very much a house for
indoor-outdoor entertaining. Come take a look
and see this surprising property in the heart of
Catskill Village. All just minutes from Hudson
and the Amtrak Station as well as the vast
Catskill Mountain Park lands.

Built in 1860

Essential Information

MLS® # 150521

Price $589,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,600

Acres 0.04

Year Built 1860



Type Residential

Sub-Type Residential

Style Victorian

Status Sold

MLS cgndmls_sold

Community Information

Address 51 Greene

Area Catskill

Subdivision N/A

City Catskill

County Greene

State NY

Zip Code 12414

Amenities

View Local, Neighborhood, Village

Interior

Appliances Clothes Dryer, Clothes Washer, Dishwasher, Refrigerator, Stove

Heating Hot Water

Has Basement Yes

Basement Partial, Unfinished

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 2

Fireplaces Bedroom, Living Room

Exterior

Exterior Clapboard

Windows Double Hung, Storm

Roof Rolled/Hot Mop

Construction Frame

Foundation Brick/Mortar, Stone

School Information

District Catskill

Additional Information

Date Listed October 26th, 2023



Days on Market 111


