
$1,320,000 - 58 Huntington, Freehold
MLS® #151124 

$1,320,000
6 Bedroom, 5.00 Bathroom, 3,278 sqft
Residential on 16 Acres

N/A, Freehold, NY

The Wing House is a one-of-a-kind modern
estate with mid-century character, nestled at
the end of a quiet cul de sac, between hot
spots Hudson, Catskill, and Windham
Mountain. Secluded on 15 acres with
mountain views, in-ground pool, guest suites,
and pool house, there are no limits to what the
next owner can do with this property full of
unique features and vibes. The house itself,
along with the above-garage guest wing
includes 8 bedrooms and 5 bathrooms. The
open living room, sunroom, and even the full
walkout basement all feature spectacular
mountain views. The main floor includes
primary bedroom with ensuite bath, updated
kitchen with new appliances, butler's pantry,
living room with panoramic mountain views,
and attached library overlooking the pool area.
The house wraps around the large inground
pool with a wraparound deck, a separate pool
house, fire pit, and hot tub. There is ample
room to entertain with plenty of space for
privacy. Includes additional flex shed space
and a separate garage.This location provides
the best of The Hudson Valley. Close to skiing,
hiking, waterfalls, and bustling villages.
Currently used as a successful Airbnb. 2.5 hrs
to NYC. 15 min to Catskill Village. 25 min to
Hudson.

Built in 1960

Essential Information



MLS® # 151124

Price $1,320,000

Bedrooms 6

Bathrooms 5.00

Full Baths 3

Half Baths 2

Square Footage 3,278

Acres 15.50

Year Built 1960

Type Residential

Sub-Type Residential

Style Contemporary

Status Sold

MLS cgndmls_sold

Community Information

Address 58 Huntington

Area Freehold

Subdivision N/A

City Freehold

County Greene

State NY

Zip Code 12431

Amenities

# of Garages 4

Garages Attached, Detached

View Catskills, Far Reaching, Mountain, Panoramic

Has Pool Yes

Interior

Appliances Clothes Dryer, Clothes Washer, Dishwasher, Refrigerator, Stove

Heating Forced, Hot Air

Cooling Central Air

Has Basement Yes

Basement Finished, Full, Walkout

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 2

Fireplaces Basement, Living Room



Exterior

Exterior Clapboard, Wood

Windows Casement, Double Hung, Display

Roof Asphalt, Rubber, Shingle

Construction Frame

Foundation Poured Concrete

School Information

District Greenville

Additional Information

Date Listed January 6th, 2024

Days on Market 30


