
$300,000 - 6 Cherokee Drive, Milton
MLS® #20240539 

$300,000
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,440 sqft
Residential on 0 Acres

N/A, Milton, NY

The price is right for this solid Ranch with huge
potential! The pebble-lined walkway leads to a
covered front porch and entrance to the main
level. Inside, there is a spacious living room
with vaulted ceilings and hardwood floors. The
oversized kitchen has tile counters and an
abundance of wood cabinets. Plenty of room
to add a kitchen island! There is also a formal
dining room off the kitchen with hardwood
floors, vaulted ceiling and deck access.
Completing the main level are two bedrooms
and a full bathroom. Downstairs you will find a
finished rec room and office with a walk-out
door to the driveway. There is also a huge
bonus space with 576 sq ft that can be used
as an artist's studio, workshop or just extra
storage. You can relax on the wrap-around
deck off the back of the house providing
beautiful, seasonal Hudson River views! There
is a one-car garage and ample driveway
parking. This house has so many possibilities
for the right buyers!

Built in 1969

Essential Information

MLS® # 20240539

Price $300,000

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,440



Acres 0.48

Year Built 1969

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Ranch

Status Closed

MLS ucbr_sold

Community Information

Address 6 Cherokee Drive

Area Marlboro

Subdivision N/A

City Milton

County Ulster

State NY

Zip Code 12547

Amenities

Parking Driveway

# of Garages 1

View River, Other

Interior

Interior Features Vaulted Ceiling(s)

Appliances Water Heater, Washer, Refrigerator, Range, Electric Water Heater,
Dryer, Dishwasher

Heating Baseboard, Electric

Cooling Central Air, Ductless

Has Basement Yes

Basement Full, Walk-Out Access

Exterior

Exterior Block, Frame, Vinyl Siding

Roof Asphalt, Shingle

Construction Block, Frame, Vinyl Siding

School Information

District Marlboro Central

Elementary Marlboro K-5



Additional Information

Date Listed April 30th, 2024

Days on Market 108

Zoning R1


