
$1,475,000 - 6036 Albany Post Rd, Rhinebeck
MLS® #151288 

$1,475,000
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 2,077 sqft
Residential on 59 Acres

N/A, Rhinebeck, NY

Welcome to The Ambrose House, a 60-acre
property just one mile outside the historic
Village of Rhinebeck. Embracing the vast
landscape is a meticulously upgraded
Farmhouse home, dating back to the 1837 and
continuously upgraded year after year - as
evidenced by preserved deeds dating back to
the 1800's. A nature escape all within minutes
to local amenities and the upcoming SoHo
House. As you approach via a 600-foot
driveway, a newly improved spacious landing
welcomes you. Stepping inside the farmhouse,
discover a gourmet open eat-in kitchen,
adorned with high-end Bosch and Thermador
appliances, stainless steel finishes, and an
expansive granite island. Two wood-burning
fireplaces radiate warmth and charm,
complementing the radiant floor heating across
three zones. Modern comforts include new
forced air heating and central AC, while
floor-to-ceiling custom windows bathe the main
room in natural light. It features a detached
two-car garage, a separate entrance for
ATV/UTV vehicles, and a standalone propane
heating system.Situated within an old-growth
hardwood forest with abundant wildlife, the
estate offers 3 miles of trails winding through
the property, ideal for hiking, ATV adventures,
and leisurely horseback rides. The tranquil
Fallsburg Creek flows along the southern
border, while protected wetlands guarantee
seclusion and hand-built stone walls envelop
the property. Professionally landscaped
surroundings include a separately fenced



garden area for fruit trees and flowers,
perennial gardens, and meditation labyrinth.
Given the 370 feet of road frontage suitable for
an additional driveway, this property also
offers the opportunity to build or
subdivide.Minutes away from shopping,
award-winning restaurants, Northern Dutchess
Hospital, Rhinebeck schools, and a 7-minute
drive to the Amtrak station, this property is an
ideal full-time residence or weekend retreat.
Take this opportunity to own a piece of history
with The Ambrose House, and join a legacy of
care and appreciation spanning generations.

Built in 1837

Essential Information

MLS® # 151288

Price $1,475,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 2,077

Acres 59.28

Year Built 1837

Type Residential

Sub-Type Residential

Style Farm House

Status Sold

MLS cgndmls_sold

Community Information

Address 6036 Albany Post Rd

Area Rhinebeck

Subdivision N/A

City Rhinebeck

County Dutchess

State NY

Zip Code 12572-3623



Amenities

View Wooded

Interior

Appliances Clothes Dryer, Clothes Washer, Counter Top Range, Dishwasher, Wall
Oven, Refrigerator, Water Treatment

Heating Forced, Radiator

Cooling Central Air

Has Basement Yes

Basement Partial, Unfinished

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 2

Exterior

Exterior Wood

Windows Double Hung

Roof Metal

Construction Frame

Foundation Stone

School Information

District Rhinebeck

Additional Information

Date Listed January 25th, 2024

Days on Market 47


