
$1,650 - 89 John Street, Kingston
MLS® #20231584 

$1,650
0 Bedroom, 0.00 Bathroom, 1,200 sqft
Commercial on 0 Acres

N/A, Kingston, NY

This office space is conveniently located in
Uptown Kingston. This building has a lovely
landscaped back yard on one of the oldest
streets in the city. It is a two story brick
building with office space for lease on the
bottom floor. The owner lives upstairs.
Downstairs on ground level there is
approximately a 1,200 sq ft space that is
handicap accessible with portable ramp that is
provided, but no permanent structure. There is
a waiting room reception area, two private
offices, two bathrooms,  an administrative area
and another back room that can be used as
another  office or a break room for the 
employees. This would be perfect for an
attorney or its current use, a doctors office.
There is a front and rear entrance. There is a
huge lot for parking behind the building as well
as on street parking.

Built in 1925

Essential Information

MLS® # 20231584

Price $1,650

Bathrooms 0.00

Square Footage 1,200

Acres 0.00

Year Built 1925

Type Commercial

Sub-Type Office



Status Closed

MLS ucbr_sold

Community Information

Address 89 John Street

Area Kingston,City

Subdivision N/A

City Kingston

State NY

Zip Code 12401

Interior

Appliances Water Heater, Electric Water Heater

Heating Baseboard, Natural Gas

Cooling Central Air

Has Basement Yes

Basement Full

Exterior

Lot Description City Lot, Landscaped

School Information

District Kingston Consolidated

Additional Information

Date Listed June 8th, 2023

Days on Market 435

Zoning C-2 Cenral comm


